Muhammad Azeem

From: NAZISH MANSOOR <noorulhudanaz@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 14, 2025 4:34 PM

To: Muhammad Azeem

Subject: Re: Reimbursement for the expenses due to the accident of UCPO Nazish Mansoor
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Respected Sir,

Refer to your email dated 12.05.2025. I am enclosing herewith medical documents for your kind perusal and my
detail is given below:

Name: NAZISH MANSOOR
Employee ID : 1145
Position: UCPO

Town: GULBERG

UC: 30 YASEENABAD
CNIC : 42101-1258740-0
Mobile No.0310-1379049

REGARDS

On Mon, May 12, 2025 at 10:27 PM Muhammad Azeem <hrmatters.karachi@chipconsulting.org> wrote:

Dear Nazish,

Please provide complete details with NIC number and attach medical documents.

If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us know.

Best Regards:
Muhammad Azeem
Project HR Associate

CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd. 603, Ibraheem Trade Tower
Karachi,



Sindh, Pakistan.

Cell No: 03458566270

TRAINING &
CONSULTING

From: NAZISH MANSOOR [mailto:noorulhudanaz@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, May 8, 2025 4:02 PM

To: Raheel Ali

Subject: Reimbursement for the expenses due to the accident of UCPO Nazish Mansoor

Dear concerns,

I am writing this email regarding my injuries which occurred on 9th April 2025, when I was on duty and after
completing my operational work, while going into the field, I met an accident where I had severe head injuries
and got stitches on my head. Further I had injuries in the collar bone and was admitted in. Hospital.

I was rushed to the hospital where I had stitches and was given off due to the accident.

I want to apply for the reimbursement of my expenses as per SOPs of CTC. Kindly help me get the expenses
back from the insurance I have.

Regards,



