
From: Ab Gafar [mailto:abgafar150@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, April 7, 2020 2:53 PM 
To: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk> 
Subject: Re: FW: Document from Abdulghaffar 

 

Respected madam! 

Plz closed my insurance subject because I have no proper Documentation. I treat in Karachi.  

Karachi is so far away .I have no objection.  

Ucpo district sherani uc mani khuwa.  

 

On Tue, 7 Apr 2020, 2:42 pm Ab Gafar, <abgafar150@gmail.com> wrote: 

Ucpo= 

Pro.Balochistan 

 district .sherani  

Uc. mani khuwa  

یڈم سلام!م کم ا ی ل  !اع

یں فار م غ بدال د ع ک ول مال بدال یو مجھے جب ع ول ین پ پ م ے ک ے ک سے حوال یز  یوت ٹ ک ے ای  دوران ک

ند وں چ وگ ے ل وب مجھے ن یا زدک یں اور ک ے م ز ن ے رول ق ک ٹ مطاب ٹرک س ی ڈ یران ش ے   PEO ک

ٹر ورا ڈاک صاحب خان ن و   کمل ک ت م سے حالا ہ  ا ا اگ ردی ے اس اور ک یا allowed تدرخواس مجھے ن  اور ک

یں ے م سے Ctc ن تماس  ی ال ے اس اور ک ست مجھے ن ی درخوا یاد ک ن ر ب ے علاج پ ئے ک  اور دی اجازت ل

یں ے م راچی ن یں ک د م راچی علاج مزی یں ک یا م کن ک ی یب مجھے ل رت ی ت سمجھ ک یں  ہ ھی ن اں ت  وہ

راچی یں ک ٹس وہ م ن وم یں ڈاک ہ م نا ن کا ب س و Ctc جو  لوب ک یں مط ہ اور ہ راچی ن یں ک رام م ی ی وئ  ک

سا ہ ای ند یں موجود ب ہ ہ یں ک سے اس م ین  وان ے ق ق ک ٹس مطاب ن وم ب ڈاک رو مرت کو ک س کن ا ی یرا ل  م

ر علاج ی پ اف گا خرچہ ک یرا اور ل لق م ع تان ت س لوچ ٹ ب ٹرک س ی ڈ یران ش ین  ون ی ی ہ مان یں خوا ک م  ای

ہ د سمان دان پ ے اور خان سے علاق یں   ۔ ھ

 

On Mon, 2 Mar 2020, 4:45 pm Sabeela, <sabeela@ctc.org.pk> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

  

Well noted thanks for your kind response. 

  

If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us 
know. 

  

Regards, 

Sabeela Pasha 

mailto:abgafar150@gmail.com
mailto:sabeela@ctc.org.pk


Regional Coordinator - PTPP 

CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd. 

0340-8442588     

  

From: Noora Kakar [mailto:noorakakar72@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 4:27 PM 
To: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk> 
Subject: Re: FW: Document from Abdulghaffar 

  

As per my telephonic conversation with him, he has no any medical receipt to claim for his 

medical expenses and reimbersement 

Thanks & Regards 

  

On Thu, 26 Dec 2019 at 11:46 AM, Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk> wrote: 

  

  

If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us 
know. 

  

Regards, 

Sabeela Pasha 

Regional Coordinator - PTPP 

CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd. 

0340-8442588     

  

mailto:noorakakar72@gmail.com
mailto:sabeela@ctc.org.pk
mailto:sabeela@ctc.org.pk


From: Ab Gafar [mailto:abgafar150@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, December 26, 2019 12:38 AM 
To: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk> 
Subject: Document from Abdulghaffar 

  

Document (1)  

--  

Dr Noora Khan 

PEO/ Sherani 

+92321-8115609 
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