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Raheel Ali

From: Raheel Ali <hrmatters.karachi@chipconsulting.org>
Sent: Tuesday, March 19, 2024 9:51 AM
To: 'Noor ul Huda'
Cc: 'KHALID, Nadia'; 'mohammadazeem640@gmail.com'; 

'hrmatters.isb@chipconsulting.org'; 'rafat.badar@chipconsulting.org'; 
'ff.malir@chipconsulting.org'

Subject: RE: Insurance Claim : CHW Anum UC-1 Muzafarabad
Attachments: DOCTER FORM.pdf; EMPLOY FORM 1.pdf; EMPLOY FORM.pdf

Dear Noor, 
 
Please dispatch all medical documents of CHW, Anum  holding CNIC: 4250116789422 
Kindly fill out the DS1 and DS2 forms from their doctor, along with the remaining form, and 
dispatch them with all medical documents and a copy of the CNIC to CHIP Training & 
Consulting. (PVT) Ltd. Office no 201, Business Arcade 
 
Karachi ,Sindh 
Pakistan 
 
If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us know. 
 
Best Regards: 
 
Raheel Ali 
Project Officer  
CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd. 201, Business Arcade  
Karachi, 
Sindh, Pakistan. 
Cell No: 03458566270 

 
 
From: Noor ul Huda [mailto:noorulhuda240@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, March 18, 2024 12:30 PM 
To: Hrmatters.karachi@chipconsulting.org 
Cc: KHALID, Nadia <nkhalid@who.int>; mohammadazeem640@gmail.com 
Subject: Re: Insurance Claim : CHW Anum UC-1 Muzafarabad 
 
 
Dear Sir / Madam  
 
Following are the details of CHW Anum  
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District: Malir 
Town : Landhi  
UC : Muzafarabad 1 
Name : Anum Nisa 
Designation: CHW  
Contact No : 03152187926 
NIC : 42501-1678942-2 
 
 
 
Thanks  
 
On Sun, Mar 17, 2024, 3:28 PM Noor ul Huda <noorulhuda240@gmail.com> wrote: 

 
 
Dear Sir / Madam  
 
For your information.  
 
---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Noor ul Huda <noorulhuda240@gmail.com> 
Date: Sun, Mar 17, 2024, 3:24 PM 
Subject: Insurance Claim : CHW Anum UC-1 Muzafarabad 
To: KHALID, Nadia <nkhalid@who.int>, <hrmatters.karachi@chipconsultant.org> 
Cc: <mohammadazeem640@gmail.com> 
 

 
 
Dear Sir / Madam  
 
 
Iam writing this email to inform you about the road accident happened with CHW Anum on Campaign day 6 
dated 3rd March. She was coming to TSC in morning with her brother on Motorbike and got hit by the Hi-
Roof at Hospital Chorangi.  
 
She was taken to Jinnah hospital in an ambulance on immediate basis and had severe injury on arm, head and 
back. Her arm got fractured. Relevant medical tests were done there. After one day admitted in Jinnah hospital 
and under observation of doctors she got discharged and now being medically treated at Bukhari hospital. 
Doctors recommended complete bed rest to her due to which she is on leave from 3rd March to till today.  
 
It turned out to be heavy medical expense for her. For reference iam attaching medical documents. It would be 
great if you consider this case and approve the insurance claim at earliest.  
 
 
Looking forward for your response.  
 
 
 
 
Thankyou 
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Noorulhuda 
UCOO UC-1 Muzafarabad 
03141323153 
 

 


