From: Nazeer ahmad [mailto:nazeer_era@hotmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 7,2020 12:11 PM

To: 'BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar' <bugtim@who.int>; 'DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu' <demeket@who.int>;
Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>

Cc: 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; '"AHMED, Mansoor' <manahmed@who.int>; '‘Zarkoon, Safdar Khan'
<zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: Re: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Miss. Sabeela,
With reference to the above conversation, | have deposited the amount of Rs. 50400. in CTC
Account.

Kindly see the deposit slip and complete the documentation process asap.

Note: attachment is given below
Regards






Get Outlook for Android

From: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>

Sent: Monday, July 6, 2020 3:39:03 PM

To: 'Nazeer ahmad' <nazeer era@hotmail.com>; 'BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar' <bugtim@who.int>;
'DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu' <demeket@who.int>

Cc: 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; '"AHMED, Mansoor' <manahmed@who.int>; 'Zarkoon, Safdar Khan'
<zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: RE: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Mr. Nazeer,

your gross one month salary is 50,400/Rs. and you can transfer the
amount on the below mentioned account detail. further as you transfer the
amount take the screen short of transection confirmation message and
share accordingly.

If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us
know.

Regards,

Sabeela Pasha

Regional Coordinator - PTPP

CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd.
0340-8442588

From: Nazeer ahmad [mailto:nazeer era@hotmail.com]

Sent: Monday, July 6, 2020 3:18 PM

To: 'BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar' <bugtim@who.int>; 'DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu' <demeket@who.int>;
Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>

Cc: 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; '"AHMED, Mansoor' <manahmed@who.int>; 'Zarkoon, Safdar Khan'
<zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: Re: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Miss Sabeela,
Just let me know the axact amount to be submitted and is the online transfer from my account
acceptable for submission.

Regards
Nazeer Ahmed
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From: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>

Sent: Monday, July 6, 2020 3:08:42 PM

To: 'Nazeer ahmad' <nazeer era@hotmail.com>; 'BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar' <bugtim@who.int>;
'DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu' <demeket@who.int>

Cc: 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; 'AHMED, Mansoor' <manahmed@who.int>; 'Zarkoon, Safdar Khan'
<zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: RE: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Mr. Nazeer,

Please find below the detail of CTC account on which you need to submit
your gross one month salary in lieu of notice period

Title: Chip Training & Consulting PVT LTD
Bank Name: Standard Chartered

Account Number: 08992558902

F7 Markaz Branch Islamabad

As you transferred the amount please update so that further process will
proceed accordingly.

If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us
know.

Regards,

Sabeela Pasha

Regional Coordinator - PTPP

CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd.
0340-8442588

From: Nazeer ahmad [mailto:nazeer era@hotmail.com]

Sent: Monday, July 6, 2020 12:59 PM

To: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>; BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar <bugtim@who.int>; DEMEKE, Temesgen
Atsedu <demeket@who.int>

Cc: 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; AHMED, Mansoor <manahmed@who.int>; Zarkoon, Safdar Khan
<zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: Re: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Miss. Sabeela,


https://aka.ms/ghei36
mailto:sabeela@ctc.org.pk
mailto:nazeer_era@hotmail.com
mailto:bugtim@who.int
mailto:demeket@who.int
mailto:naila@ctc.org.pk
mailto:manahmed@who.int
mailto:zarkoons@who.int
mailto:nazeer_era@hotmail.com
mailto:sabeela@ctc.org.pk
mailto:bugtim@who.int
mailto:demeket@who.int
mailto:naila@ctc.org.pk
mailto:manahmed@who.int
mailto:zarkoons@who.int

Thanks for your kind support. It's here that | am resigning job of UC polio Officer kharotabad 1
on short notice and agree to submit on salary on behalf of prior notice with emidiate effect on 30
June 2020.

It requested to send me the details of one month salary submition process and my contract with
experience letter.

Thanks
Best regards
Nazeer Ahmed

Get Outlook for Android

From: DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu <demeket@who.int>

Sent: Monday, July 6, 2020 12:12:58 PM

To: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>; BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar <bugtim@who.int>; 'Nazeer ahmad'
<nazeer_era@hotmail.com>

Cc: 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; AHMED, Mansoor <manahmed@who.int>; Zarkoon, Safdar Khan
<zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: RE: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Yes, kindly go ahead with the necessary action based on SOPs. Thanks

With Kind Regards

Temesgen A Demeke

Team Leader Balochistan

Polio Eradication initiative - WHO Pakistan
Serena Bazaar, Quetta

Email: demeke@who.int

Phone +923003400530
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From: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>

Sent: Monday, July 6, 2020 11:59 AM

To: BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar <bugtim@who.int>; 'Nazeer ahmad' <nazeer era@hotmail.com>
Cc: DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu <demeket@who.int>; 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; AHMED,
Mansoor <manahmed@who.int>; Zarkoon, Safdar Khan <zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: RE: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Sir,

Thanks for the email.Please be informed that as per SOPs
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a person has to serve one month prior notice or in lieu of notice period he
has to give one month gross salary. policy has mentioned below for your
information.

5.2. Resignation

Any employee who has completed their probation period may resign from
the service of the company after providing one month’s prior notice in
writing or, in lieu of notice, pay to the Company an amount equal to one
month’s gross pay for the notice period and settle all dues and return all
properties of the Company.

If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us
know.

Regards,

Sabeela Pasha

Regional Coordinator - PTPP

CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd.
0340-8442588

From: BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar [mailto:bugtim@who.int]

Sent: Sunday, July 5, 2020 12:20 AM

To: sabeela@ctc.org.pk; Nazeer ahmad <nazeer era@hotmail.com>

Cc: DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu <demeket@who.int>; Naila Nizam <naila@ctc.org.pk>; AHMED,
Mansoor <manahmed@who.int>; Zarkoon, Safdar Khan <zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: RE: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Sabeela

Thank you for communication regarding one of our UCPO in Quetta.l want to clear myself regarding HR
policy of CTC regarding this type of situation as mentioned in below emails.

Is there any policy other than one month notice, like Waive off policy ,submission of one month salary or
request to terminate his contract which was signed with us just start of this month.

With best regards.

From: sabeela@ctc.org.pk <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>
Sent: Saturday, 4 July 2020 11:41 PM
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To: Nazeer ahmad <nazeer era@hotmail.com>

Cc: DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu <demeket@who.int>; Naila Nizam <naila@ctc.org.pk>; BUGTI,
Muhammad Anwar <bugtim@who.int>; AHMED, Mansoor <manahmed@who.int>; Zarkoon, Safdar
Khan <zarkoons@who.int>

Subject: Re[2]: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Mr. Nazeer,

Please be informed that As Per SOP for resign one month prior notice is mendatory otherwise
contract will be concluded.

Which you have been told already in several SOPs sessions.
So please let us know that are you giving resign with one month prior notice or we take action as
per SOP?

Thanks and Regards
Sabeela Pasha

Saturday, 04 July 2020, 10:46PM +05:00 from Nazeer ahmad nazeer era@hotmail.com:

Dear All representatives,

It is here to inform you, that | was appeared in the test and interview for the position of DHCSO
Zhob and on 2nd july 2020, | was informed that you have being short listed for the position, So,
you will have to attend the induction training on 3rd and 4th July on emergency need basis.

As per the CTC you will be given contract after resident and locality verification, | had informed
my supervisors for such situation on need basis for attending training. Still at the time my
position was not clear before the verification.

Today | was informed was informed that your verification has been done and recommended for
the position of DHCSO Zhob, and still | have not yet received my contract from CTC.

It is therefore requested that kindly accept my resignation from for the position of UC Polio
Officer Kharotabad 1 on short notice as per the SOPs.

Looking forward for your prompt response.

Thanks

Best regards

Nazeer Ahmed
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From: Zarkoon, Safdar Khan <zarkoons@who.int>

Sent: Saturday, July 4, 2020 6:50 PM

To: Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk>

Cc: nazeer _era@hotmail.com <nazeer era@hotmail.com>; DEMEKE, Temesgen Atsedu
<demeket@who.int>; 'Naila Nizam' <naila@ctc.org.pk>; BUGTI, Muhammad Anwar <bugtim@who.int>;
AHMED, Mansoor <manahmed@who.int>

Subject: Re: [EXT] confirmation about staff presences on field

Dear Sabeela,

Thanks for the email.l was updated by Mr.Nazeer that he has been selected as DHCSO Zhob.| wish him
success for his new assignment.Your good self should also have been updated accordingly.

Dear Nazeer,

Please coordinate with Miss Sabeela and follow all the SOPs as per her guidance.lt needs to be done
ASAP.

Regards
Dr Safdar

On 4 Jul 2020 17:43, Sabeela <sabeela@ctc.org.pk> wrote:
Dear Mr. Nazeer,

Could you please confirm me about your presences on the field.

were you present on the field on 3rd and 4th July 2020?

If you need any further information regarding the same, please let us
know.

Regards,

Sabeela Pasha

Regional Coordinator - PTPP

CHIP Training & Consulting (Pvt) Ltd.
0340-8442588
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